DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVIGES
FOQD AND DRUG AOMINISTRATION

OISTRICT OFFIGE ADDRESS AND PHONE NUMBER DATE(S) OF INSPECTION
International Compliance Team, DMPQ/OC/CDER, FDA Fab. 20, 21, 22, 25 & 26, 2008

White Oak Buiding 51, 4™ Floor ‘ FEI NUMBER ;

10903 New llampshire Avenue ;
Silver Spring, MD 20993 USA (301) 827 - g9 2 W
L

"NAME AND TITLE OF INDIVIOUAL TO WHOM REPORT IS ISSUED
TO: M, Yan'Wang, General Manager

 FIRM NAME : ¥ — | STREET ADDRESS
Changzhou 8PL Company, Ltd 3 Changhong Wesat Road

CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE TYPE OF ESTABLIBHMENT INSPECTED

Wujing, Changzhou City, Jiangsu Province, China L.l‘\“Pl {animal origin) Manufacturer
"YHIE DOGUMENT [1STS UBSERVATIONG MADE BY THE FA REPREGENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INGPEGTION OF YOUR FACILITY. THEY ARE INSPELTIONAL GBSERVATKING, AND DO NOT
REPRESENT A FINAL AGENCY BETERMNATION REGARDING YOUR COMPLIANCE. IF YOU HAVE AN ORJECTION REGARDING AN OBSERVATION, OR HAVE IMPLEMINTED, OR PLAN TO

IMPLEMENY, CORRECTIVE ACTION IN RESPONSE TO AN OBBERVATION, YOU MAY DISCUSS THE OBUECTION OR ACTION WITH THE FOW REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INSPECTION
OR SUBMIT THS INFORMAYION TO FDA AT THE ADDRESS ABOVE. If YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTACT FDA AT THE PHONE NUMBER AND ADORESS ABOVE.

DURING AN INSPECTION OF YOUR FIRMws ORIERVED: o
1. Thers have been no critical provessing steps jdentificd for the Heparin Sodium USPL ) ]pruccss, and, the repeated
and efficient removal of impurities, such as proteins, nucleotides, virus, endotoxin, bactéria and héavy metals af the appropriate,
specified, process steps has not been evaluated. There was no report for annual L resulty nvailable.

The improvements offered by removal of s raw material} Jes@l. j a batch size increase, an added
-isk:p' achange in} for thet js:ep ans(;lr and parameter changes,
pproved ina 1/05 process validation report for Heparin Sodium USP, were not demonstrated. = ’

2. There has been no impurity profile established for Heparin Sodium USP and no evaluation far degradants during stability
program testing.

3. The manufacturing instructions for Heparin Sodium USP are incomplete in that they do not include a description of manual
manipulations of th during processinyg steps, they do not include the actual, manually entered i set
tonsperatures and times and, opetator observations such as level measurements, used in calculations, during theL~ 15(2}; are
not recorded. '

4. There has been 1o Lest method verification porformed for the reported USP test methods, Nitrogen Determinsation, Protein and
“Total Acrobic Microbial Count, employed in testing of Heparin Sodium USP and Heparin-Crude materials, show that the
mcthods are suitoble under actual conditions of use,  in mdition, there is no routine test fi g)rnsidue amount at the time -

of release. ?

5. Investigations intv fuiled lots and out of trend lots were approved as complete, but did not identify & cause for the problem.
For example, . ; '

Heparin Sudium USP batchL w]nﬁxiled the Nitrogen Determination test and was reprocessed to muke L ” ‘1
without finding the reaso; he slightly high, OOS Nitrogen result. :

h;vesﬁgat%g wswmaL 'peciﬁmidn@i or Heparin Sodium USP lots Stsmemiim:
and | hsCre nerformed wit nowing what the faited test measurement actually represented.
] :IM,( e B ok i y rep

re
[nvestigations into ROT out ol trend results for Heparin Sodium USP tots] T ' Jidentifiod both results

inappropriately as outliers,

6. Heparin Crude lots|_ received 8/06 fram vendor M .
; that included material from an unacceptuble workshop vendor were used in Heparin Sudium USP
| marketed to the USA, . In addition, prior to 3/06 there arc no| ]rewrds from vendurli
Jshowing the source for their crude materlals. - 4

.. The inside surface of large, “cleaned™ lt.mks used in the ﬂnel{H ]s:ep, afler both
] lwcn: very scratchod, with unidentified maférial adhering to the insidés and, the inverted handles held liguid, which
spilled to e-bottom of the tunk when it was uprighted, ‘There was no written procedure showing that the tanks were dedicatod
to a particular process step. There was no datu collected to verify marker and tape volume markings on the outside of the tunks
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DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES
FOOD AND DRUG ADMINISTRATION

DISTRICT OFFIGE ADDRESS AND PHONE NUMBER

White Oak Buiding 51, 4™ Floor
10303 New Hampshire Avenue
Silver Spring, MD 20993 USA

Internarional Compliance Team, DMPQ/OC/CDER, FDA

DATE(R) OF INSPECTION
Feb. 20, 21, 22, 25 & 26, 2008

FEI NUMBER

NAME AND TITLE OF INDIVIDUAL TO WHOM REPORT IS ISSUED

TO:' Mr.Yan Wang, General Manager

[ FIRMNAVE .

Changzhou SPL Company, Ltd

STREET ADDRESS )
3 Changhong West Road

CITY, STATE AND ZIP CQDE
Wullng, Changzhou City, Jlangsu Province, China

TYPE OF ESTABLISHMENT INSPECTED
API (animal origin) Manufacturer

"THES DOCUMENT LISTS OBBERVATIONS MADE BY THE FDA REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INGPECTION OF YOUR FAGILITY. YHEY ARE INGPEC T IONAL OBGERVATIONS, AND DO NOT
REPRESINT A FINAL AGENCY DEYERMINATION REGARDING YOUR COMPLIANGE. IF YOU HAVE AN DBJECTION REGARDING AN DBSERVATION, OR HAVE IMPLEMENTED, OR PLAN YO
IMPLEMENT, CORRECTIVE ACTION [N RESPONSE TO AN ORSERVATION, YOU MAY DISCUSS THE OBJKCTION OR ACTION WITH THE FDA REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INSPECTION
OR SUBMIT THIG INFORMATION TO FDA AT THE ABDRESS ABOVE. IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, PLEAGE CONTACT FDA AT THE PHONE NUMBER ANLY ADDRESS ABOVE,

DURING AN INSPECTION OF YOUR FIRMwa  CBSERVED: 2

and, the cleaning method was not validated. It was noted that equipment clenning tags were made of paper and taped o the
picce of equipment unproteclod from liquids used in the processing room environments.

8. Raw material inventory records were jncomplete in that samples removed from the containers and the staus and amount of
materials returned from use by the production processing department were not recorded. Fur'tr _] stored in a freczer,

the amount, condition and date of return was niot recorded. =
9. Control of material flow in the processing area was inadequate in that waste _Swns carted through a door to the outside
in the processing avea and not provided for by the material flow written procediite.

| manufactured and held since 5/25/07, are not labeled.

o}

10. The outer foil bags containing Heparin Sodium USP lotL
The drum lid showed the only indications of the lot number.

11, There is no report or data to show that leachables for the[;

-"hags used to hold Heparin Sodium 1S lot, have besn
evaluated. o .

EMPLOYEE(S) NAME AND TITLE (Print or Typs)
Regina T. Brown, Invegtigator

DATE ISSUED
Feb. 28, 2008

REVERSE
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The obsgervations of oblectconable conditions and practices hsted on the front of this form
are reported:

1. ‘Pursuant to Section 704(b) of the Federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act, or
2. To assist firms inspected in complying with the Acta and regulations enforced by the

Food and Drug Administration,

Section 704(b) of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 USC 374(b)) provides:

"Upon completion of any such inspection of a factory, warehouse, consuiting
laboratory, or other establishment, and prior to leaving the premises, the officer or
employee making the inspection shall give to the owner, operator, or agent in charge 2
report in writing setting forth any conditions or practines observed by him which, in his
judgment, Indicate that any food, drug, device, or cosmetic in such establishment (1)
consists in whole or in part of any fithy, putrid, or decomposed substance, or (2) has
been prepared, packed, or held under unsanitary conditions whereby it may have become
contaminated with filth, or whereby it may have been rendered injurious to health. A copy

of such report shall be sent promptly to the Secretary.”

FORM FDA 483 (4/03)

£d

80:2¢ 848c 9 924

‘ON X9dd

: WO





